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Abstract: School physical education was an important part of the lifelong sports, and there were vital influ-
ence of the concept of lifelong sports on the education teaching reform of school physical education. It was 
the real need of human society on the concept of lifetime sports which was put forward by the experts, and 
school physical education as the basis of lifetime sports, which was essential to cultivate students' awareness 
of lifelong sports with lifetime sports skills. Hence, in this paper, the relationship of lifelong sports and col-
lege physical education were explored using the scientific research mothods of literature material anlysis, 
questionnaire surveying and statistics, and the current situations of physical education teaching in colleges 
and universities were also investigated in hunan province, so as to give some advices for the reform of college 
physical education, and to lay a foundation for the implementation of lifetime sports. 
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1. Introduction 
College physical education was the important process of 
the sports practice and physical education teaching, and 
also, it was the basic stages of lifelong exercise. College 
physical education teaching was the most standarization 
and systematization stage to the students. it was the most 
important period to cultivate individual lifetime sports 
consciousness and improve the ability of lifelong sports 
and form lifetime sports concept. So the college physical 
education teaching had an important status to cultivate 
the students’ lifetime sports concept. Colleges and uni-
versities were the base of cultivating the talents, and 
physical education teaching was the basis of training 
physical fitness[1]. A qualified personnel should not only 
have profound professional knowledge, also must have a 
healthy body. College physical education teaching was 
not only a simple for students to have PE lessons, the 
most important was to let students understand sports 
knowledge, master certain fitness method, and have the 
physical exercise habit. Colleges and universities physi-
cal education teaching should be timely to strengthen 
students' subject consciousness, improve the ability of 
independent exercise, strengthen the concept of lifetime 
sports, master the knowledge and the correct method of 
exercise. 
The students in colleges and universities were in the pe-
riod of normal development, and they were the most pre-
cious and were the most distinctive golden era in life. In 
the stage of vigor and vitality[2], the college students 

would build their own concept on physical exercise if the 
sports teachers can imbue with practical teaching con-
tents, impart systematically the method of scientific exer-
cise combined with the good exercise equipment, envi-
ronment and the atmosphere of physical exercise. 

2. Objects and Methods 
2.1. Objects 

In order to more accurate understanding the physical 
education teaching situation in colleges and universities 
of hunan province, 100 of sports teachers and 200 of col-
lege and university students were investigated from eight 
college and university, including Hunan University, Cen-
tre southern University, college of Changsha, Hunan 
normal university, Xiangtan university, Huan university 
of scicence & technology, Hunan engering college and 
Hunan industrial university. 

2.2. Methods 

(1) Literature analysis 
According to the keywords of physical education teach-
ing, teaching structure, the universities sports teaching, 
looking at the Chinese knowledge network 
(www.cnki.net), Chinese education network 
(www.chinaedu.edu.cn), a series of literatures were ob-
tained from the core journals and academic papers, it was 
provided us the new thought and methods for the re-
searches. 
(2) Questionnair survey 
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According to the literature analysis, on the basis of the 
status quo and the current research hot spot, the ques-
tionnaire for this study was built. Then, by consulting 
relevant experts and scholars to revise and confirm the 
contents of the questionnaire. In this study, 100 of ques-
tionnair for the sports teachers and 200 of questinnair for 
the college students were issued, and 98 (98%) and 195 
(97.5%) of them were recovered respectively. The valid 
questionnaires were 90 (95%) and 188 (94%) respective. 
Before issuing the questionnair, 10 experts (3 of them 
were professor, 2 of them were vice professor and 5 of 
them were administor of physical education) were con-
sulted to assess the relability and validity of the 2 ques-
tionnairs. 90% of experts confirmed that the questionnair 
for teachers was valid, and 92% of experts confirmed that 
the questionnair for students was valid. The relability was 
checked according to the “test-retest relability”, the cor-
relation coefficient of 2 times of tests were R=0.825, 
P<0.05. 
(3) Statistics 
The SPSS 17.0 edtion was used to statistics. 

3. Results and Analysis 
3.1. The Current Situation of Physical Education 
Teaching in Colleges and Universities of Hunan 
Province under the Field of Lifetime Sports 

Physical education teaching guidance in the colleges and 
universities was the core of the basic views and under-
standing to direct the physical education teaching and 
activities. It reflects the period from the perspective of 
sports community in colleges and universities sports 
teaching to cultivate the talent requirements. With the 
development of physical education teaching reform in 
colleges and universities, the goal and the function of 
physical education teaching was heading for diversified. 
The phyical education teaching in the colleges and uni-
versities of hunan province was the status of variety of 
teaching ideas, each of them were very close but not the 
same. There were differences between each other, and 
each kind of teaching thought had its era background and 
historical origin. With the development of the national 
fitness campaign, the physical education teaching was 
puts forward the new requirements:in colleges and uni-
versities: lifetime sports was as the teaching guiding 
thought, strengthen their physical fitness was as the es-
sence. In the sports teaching either consciously or un-
consciously use some kind of guiding ideology, should 
practice of physical education and knowledge skills, the 
cultivation of the ability to balance up to promote the all-
round development of students. Through the new “na-
tional ordinary university sports curriculum teaching in-
struction summary” the guiding ideology of education 
idea was: healthy the first, quality education, lifelong 
sports ideology. But in the fact, there were 51.8% of col-

lege students not ware of the lifelong sports concept (ta-
ble 1), and they can not understand the relationship of the 
health exercise and the future life. 

 
Table 1. The survey of the lifelong sports for the students 

 Understand 
well Understand Not 

understand 
numbers 23 69 96 

rates 20.12% 36.70% 51.08% 
 

3.2. The Analysis of Physical Education Teaching 
Mode in the Colleges and Universities of Hunan 
Province 

According to investigation and survey, it was found that 
colleges and universities of Hunan province, the physical 
education teaching mode can be divided into three types. 
The first was compulsory: physical education learning 
content per semester was uniformed by the colleges and 
universities, it paid more attention to the student skills. 
The second was a compulsory add up to elective: physi-
cal education learning content in the grade one was un-
iformed and compulsory course, students can choose the 
learning coures according to their interest in grade two, it 
can choose their sports contents according to their own 
interests and hobbies, so as to stimulate students' interest 
in learning. The third was special elective course in grade 
one, and then the sports club teaching in grade two, it 
was benifit to exert students' subjective initiative, and to 
students' special skills and interests. Along with the ad-
vancement of teaching reform, the physical education 
teaching mode was varied from the original single model 
to multiple modes, and colleges and universities can be 
combination of these different teaching modes according 
to their own teaching conditions, so as to stimulate stu-
dents’ exercise interest and cultivate students' healthy 
consciousness of lifetime sports. 

3.3. The Analysis of Physical Education Teaching 
Contents 

According to table 2, it was found that the teaching con-
tents were selected mainly as the items for the examina-
tion and the equipments and teaching conditions, it was 
30.0% and 46.7% respective, and the teaching contents 
selected according to the students’ interests, physical and 
mental abilities and novel exercise items were only the 
5.6%, 14.4% and 3.3% respective. It was shown that the 
teaching contents selected relay on the concept of life-
long sports were relative lower. 
 
Table 2. The survey of physical education teaching contents 

Teaching contents Numbers Rate 
Interest for students 13 14.4% 

Items for the 
examination 27 30.0% 

Alteration for the 
students demands 5 5.6% 
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Items with novelty 3 3.3% 
Items for the 

equipments and 
conditions 

42 46.7% 

 

3.4. The Analysis of Physical Education Teaching 
Method in Colleges and Universities of Hunan Prov-
ince  

With the deepening of education reform, the diversifica-
tion of teaching methods for the sports teaching provides 
a large teaching methods which can be used for reference. 
Research new discoveries in the field of pedagogy, psy-
chology and other disciplines, combined with informa-
tion technology applied in the field of teaching, which 
had physical education teaching methods tend to be mod-
ernization, democratization, personality. As seen from 
table 3, 100% of the teachers in teaching put to use of the 
methods of explanation and demonstration combination 
with practice, and 84.4% of the teachers had the use of 
assemble and disassemble teaching method, and 45.5% 
of the teachers were used to games and match teaching 
method. The teaching method of reasonable selection and 
use was very important in the physical education teach-
ing in colleges and universities to improve the teaching 
quality, or to develop students' creative ability and inno-
vative consciousness, and even to improve sports facili-
ties. Adopting the teaching methods of physical educa-
tion teachers in Hunan province colleges and universities 
still adopt more ancient, to mobilize the students' interest 
in sports teaching method to use less, is not conducive to 
students' consciousness of lifetime sports training. 
 

Table 3. The survey of physical education teaching 
methods 

Teaching method Number Rate 

Explainning and demonstrating 90 100% 

Assemble and disassemble 76 84.4% 

Repeatedly exercise 80 88.8% 

Game and match 41 45.5% 

Multimedia teaching 25 27.7% 

others 13 14.4% 

 

3.5. The Analysis of Physical Education Teaching 
Assessment in Colleges and Universities of Hunan 
Province  

It can be seen from table 4, assessment of sports in hunan 
province colleges and universities exist two main prob-
lems: the one was to master the theoretical knowledge 
and application and the performance of the students' sub-
jective initiative in the learning process not well reflected 
in the examination, the examination of the guidance, the 
teachers and students to the learning process of the sports 

curriculum ignored, pay attention to the results evalua-
tion, to pass the examination qualified as the main goal. 
Therefore, formed a "want me to exercise" in sports 
teaching and lifelong sports the contradiction between "I 
want to exercise" "second, ignoring the individual differ-
ences, can be seen from table 4, technical standards, 
technical evaluation and score of physical quality ac-
counts for some 80% of the assessment results, the two 
parts of achievement and the students' sports foundation 
and the genetic factors have a close relationship of the 
body, and sports course and other courses of a major dif-
ference is the students in addition to its own efforts, by 
genetic factors (height, weight, etc.) is very big, the in-
fluence of individual differences is greater than the indi-
vidual differences of other course. Therefore, assessment 
should attach importance to students' individual differ-
ences, in order to improve each student's active, creative 
and self-confidence, such ability, with the purpose of the 
new physical education curriculum corresponds to a task. 
 

Table 4. The survey physical education teaching 
assessment 

Contents Basic 
knowledge Skill Physical 

fitness Attitude 

Rate 5-10% 40-80% 20-40% 10-20% 

Reqirments 
Writ 

unifiedly 
examination 

Unified 
special 
items 

Combination 
with special 

items 

Perfermance 
in class and 
attendance 

rate 

Contents Basic 
knowledge Skill Physical 

fitness Attitude 

 

4. The Counter Plan of Physical Education 
Teaching Reform and the Development of 
Colleges and Universities under the field of 
Lifelong Sports in Hunan Province 
4.1. Change the Teaching Thought, Carry out the 
Connotation of Quality Education, Establish the 
Guiding Ideology of "Lifetime Sports" 

First of all, school education should set the guiding ide-
ology of "lifetime sports". The guiding ideology was the 
soul of education. The administors of colleges and uni-
versities in charge of physical education teaching and the 
teachers should set up the guiding ideology of the life-
long sports. Second, lead teachers to explore, the lifelong 
physical education guiding ideology into the teaching 
process, constantly create has the time feeling, suitable 
for students of practical, can fully mobilize students' 
creative study method of teaching.[3] Practice how 
teachers should put by the principal role of the teacher to 
the students how to learn the barycenter offset, fully re-
spect students, care for students, pay attention to individ-
ual mental development and the cultivation of creative 
ability. To give students more free activities and space, 
the lifetime earnings during the period of school sports 
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benefit and students, the combination of the acceptance 
and the pursuit of health into the student individual in-
trinsic demand, as the body and mind coordinated devel-
opment, natural process, the pursuit of pleasure, to im-
prove students' ability of individuals to maintain health, 
strengthen the awareness of lifelong sports, satisfy self 
emotional experience, to adapt to changes in the envi-
ronment and the development of the society, raise the 
health level of the whole nation. 
4.2. The Reform of Teaching Content, Play the Do-
minant Role of Students 

To solve the problems of the teaching contents which 
were tend to form the funcation of directing to competi-
tive sports, rather than to lively happy sports or lifelong 
sports, it should reform the teaching material, so as to 
play the dominant role of students[4,5]. Tha pathway of 
reform the teaching material was to meet the damand of 
adapting to the needs of the development of student's 
body and mind. The teaching material contained the dif-
ferent contents of competitive sports, happy sports, life-
long sports. It would make the students give play to the 
dominant role in class, so as to improve the students’ 
learning attitude and behavior. 
4.3. Lifetime Sports Thought as the basis of Physical 
Education Teaching Evaluation Standard 

The guiding ideology of lifelong sports was the basis of 
evaluation the teaching contents of physical education. 
Lifelong sports under the idea of evaluating the essence 
was how to change people's values, to the value judgment 
standard for adjustment and change of school sports, the 
introduction of students' sports attitude, interest, students 
lifelong sports consciousness, habit and ability evaluation. 
Pay attention to process evaluation and diagnostic eval-

uation, the combination of formative assessment and 
summative assessment. In the practice of teaching, 
process evaluation and diagnostic evaluation were a 
process for students in physical education teaching activi-
ty in the learning effect evaluation, and formative as-
sessment and summative assessment were learning eval-
uation for students as a whole. The combination of the 
four evaluation was help for paying attention to students' 
learning process, exploring process and efforting process. 
On the other hand, it can also explain the learning effect 
to the student. And also, this kind of assessment mechan-
isms was in favor of giving an objective estimation in the 
learning attitude, the value of longlife sports and scientif-
ic exploring spirits. 
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